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Andy Vargas

Lawrence, MA According to Gary Sidell, Andy Vargas has joined Bell Tower Commercial Real
Estate Group as a sales agent. Vargas brings local market knowledge to help businesses grow
throughout the Merrimack Valley. He previously supported entrepreneurs at Entrepreneurship for All
(EforAll) where he managed the organization’s marketing during a time of expansion. Vargas is a
recognized leader on zoning reform issues and has been active in greater Haverhill real estate for
several years. His combination of service to community, business acumen and relationship building
fits perfectly with the Bell Tower Commercial Real Estate Group. Vargas previously served on the



Haverhill City Council and is currently a state representative in the Massachusetts House of
Representatives.

Bell Tower Commercial Real Estate Group leaders, Gary Sidell, president, and Fred Faust, principal,
bring decades of experience and extensive local market knowledge to serve commercial property
owners, business owners and investors. They are active in the communities they serve and adding
Vargas to the team expands and affirms their commitment to enabling thriving communities.

“I have known Andy for years and am thrilled to have him join our team. He shares a vision and
commitment to the betterment of local communities that we are passionate about.” said Sidell.

With offices in Lawrence and Lowell, the firm offers a full suite of commercial real estate services
including brokerage, property management, project management and consulting services. With an
extensive network, the team is committed to transforming properties, growing businesses and
contributing to thriving local communities.

“I am excited to join a dynamic team with a strong reputation for improving communities and
businesses through genuine relationships and strategic partnerships.” said Vargas. “Gary and Fred
have tangibly strengthened the businesses, people and places of the Merrimack Valley in so many
ways– it’s an honor to join a firm under their leadership. I look forward to growing in this role and
continuing to contribute to the vitality of our region.”

Adding Vargas to the team at Bell Tower Commercial Real Estate Group is integral to the firm’s
strategy of expanding its geographic reach to best serve clients’ commercial real estate needs with
the benefit of local market knowledge, experience and an extensive network. 
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